rom - DENVER WINDUSTRIAL CO To Reorder Dial: 303-287-2884
~ 4845 PONTIAC STREET Fax: 303-287-7711
COMMERCE CITY, CO 80022

join To - WASATCH RAILROAD CONTRACTORS  Ship To - WILL CALL * kKooK kK Date - 1/04/10
PO BOX 20425 TAG: SHOP PACKING LIST Page - 1
CHEYENNE . WY 82003 * ok ok ok kKK Time - 14.24.27
DGOCON Customer No.- 1457
307-286-2833
Order No. - 111534-00
DEL BY - MON TUE WED THU FRT 7 8 9 10 1112 1 2 3 4
3] 1/04/10 Date Ordered - 1/04/10 Date Requested - 1/04/10 Date Printed - 1/04/10
F Ordered By - BLAKE Cust. Order # - SHOP
Sh - WC Salesman # - 010 Job Name -
Fr RUY Taken By - DANO
in Line Bin Extended Freight No. of
On B/0 Hold UM Description/Stock Number No. Location Weight  Class Packages
EA 3 3000 FS THRD HALF CPLG 1.0 J1-A0
036116920

END OF PACKING LIST

T&C: You agree that the sale of these products/services s subject to all of our standard terms and conditions of sale
at www winwholesale.com/tcsale

Customer Signature: % MATERTAL RECEIVED IN GOOD CONDITION **
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Malarkey Wall

From: "Dan Jagoditsh" <djagoditsh@wrrc.us>

Date: Wednesday, October 9, 2019 10:43 AM

To: "Malarkey Wall" <malarkeywall@outlook.com>; <ar@wrrc.us>; "CJ Luce" <cjluce@wrrc.us>

Attach: Inv_WRRC331_from Wasatch_Railroad_Contractors_70044.pdf
Subject: Malarkey Wall Invoice WRRC331 from Wasatch Railroad Contractors

Mr. Wall,

Attached you will find the invoice for the parts ordered for the locomotive blow down valve. This invoice will
be acceptable for the down payment for your project.

Thanks,

Dan

Wasatch Railroad Contractors

| i :
mr;f\?’/g(l;g; Due:10/05/2019 P $1 ,571 63

Dear Malarkey Wall:

Your invoice-WRRC331 for $1,571.63 is attached. Please note that all invoices
are Net 10 terms.

Please make your payment payable to Wasatch Railroad Contractors. If paying
by ACH, please e-mail a payment remittance to ar@wrrc.us in order for your
payment to post correctly.

If you have any questions about your invoice, please reach out to our Director of
Finance at the phone number listed below.

Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,
Wasatch Railroad Contractors

3077787458

Virus-free. www.avast.com

10/9/2019
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Malarkey Wall

From: "Malarkey Wall" <malarkeywall@outlook.com>
Date: Wednesday, October 9, 2019 3:03 PM

To: "Dan Jagoditsh" <djagoditsh@wrrc.us>

Subject: Re: Malarkey Wall Invoice WRRC331 from Wasatch Railroad Contractors

Dan: I've never received anything other than the bill. All | need is the drawing of the blowdown. If you’ve sent it twice, it has
never come to my “junk” or my inbox. | don’t know what’s going on???? The invoice came just fine... Thanks, Malarkey {Please
try again..... It must come to this address, malarkeywall@outlook.com...

From: Dan Jagoditsh

Sent: Wednesday, October 9, 2019 12:05 PM

To: Malarkey Wall
Subject: Re: Malarkey Wall Invoice WRRC331 from Wasatch Railroad Contractors

I've sent you the pictures of it twice.

Dan Jagoditsh | Shop Foreman
(307) 778-7458 | wrrc.us

4

- WASATCH

Railroad Contractors

On 10/9/2019 12:03 PM, Malarkey Wall wrote:
No problem on the invoice, but I need the drawing of the lowdown!when will you send it ?
Sent from my iPhone
On Oct 9, 2019, at 10:44 AM, Dan Jagoditsh <djagoditsh@wrrc.us> wrote:
Mr. Wall,

Attached you will find the invoice for the parts ordered for the locomotive blow down valve. This
invoice will be acceptable for the down payment for your project.

Thanks,

Dan

Wasatch Railroad Contractors

wgg&g; e Amount Due: $1 ,571 63

Dear Malarkey Wall:

Your invoice-WRRC331 for $1,571.63 is attached. Please note that all invoices
are Net 10 terms.

Please make your payment payable to Wasatch Railroad Contractors. If paying
by ACH, please e-mail a payment remittance to ar@wrrc.us in order for your
payment to post correctly.

If you have any questions about your invoice, please reach out to our Director of
Finance at the phone number listed below.

10/9/2019
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Wasatch Railroad Contractors

PO Box 20425
Cheyenne, WY 82003
, Invoice # WRRC331
Bill To ; Terms
Malarkey Wall ;‘
| Vale Boiler Date 10/5/2019
% 1476 Foothill Dr.
 Vale, OR 97918
| ‘
Contract #
P.O. No.
g Quantity Description U Rate Amount ‘
} 1| This work period, we have Dan Jag working on the projech Fora T §5.00 , 85.00 N
total of 1 hour.
The work performed includes the following: | {
| *Research and order parts for blow down !
1.1893 1,250.00 1,486.63

?43 gﬁ’\?‘:/.ARKEY WALL
MONTGOMERY p|
sﬂo'fgzﬂgOND, ORgrrss 9484
-250-4224 100~ 24 34«927/111235
Pay to the Date  @CHECK Atmoy
Order of _

Bellevue
877.272.3678
calumbiabank.com

€93 ColumbiaBanl

For N/?/ .33y
LEE5L0837 me

2 __./

LOSOBS533r 5igy

- Tota $1.571.63
Payments/Credits $0.00 |
Balance Due $1,571.63
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Malarkey Wall

From: "Malarkey Wall" <malarkeywall@outlook.com>
Date: Thursday, October 17,2019 1:00 PM

To: "Dan Jagoditsh" <djagoditsh@wrrc.us>

Subject: Re: Malarkey Wall Invoice WRRC331 from Wasatch Railroad Contractors

Dan: | just got your message. | wrote the correct AMT. in my check register, but then made the check
out incorrectly!

Sorry about that. Be sure to let me know when you’ll be going to Vale so that | can
tell the Stepletons .. Thanks, Malarkey Wall

From: Dan Jagoditsh

Sent: Wednesday, October 9, 2019 10:43 AM

To: Malarkey Wall ; ar@wrrc.us ; CJ Luce

Subject: Malarkey Wall Invoice WRRC331 from Wasatch Railroad Contractors
Mr. Wall,

Attached you will find the invoice for the parts ordered for the locomotive blow down valve. This
invoice will be acceptable for the down payment for your project.

Thanks,

Dan

Wasatch Railroad Contractors

Invoi 100572
V:/]%’;gégse‘; e TR Amount Due: $1 ,571 63

Dear Malarkey Wall:

Your invoice-WRRC331 for $1,571.63 is attached. Please note that all invoices
are Net 10 terms.

Please make your payment payable to Wasatch Railroad Contractors. If paying
by ACH, please e-mail a payment remittance to ar@wrrc.us in order for your

10/17/2019
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payment to post correctly.

If you have any questions about your invoice, please reach out to our Director of
Finance at the phone number listed below.

Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,
Wasatch Railroad Contractors

3077787458

Virus-free. www.avast.com

10/17/2019




ey vy C T







Malarkey Wall

Page 1 of 2

From: "Dan Jagoditsh" <djagoditsh@wrrc.us>
Date: Thursday, October 10, 2019 9:45 AM
To: "Malarkey Wall" <malarkeywall@outlook.com>

Subject: Re: Blowdown
Mr. Wall,
Yes sir, It will be on the front of the fire box, also called the throat sheet. On the lower portion, just like in the pictures.
Thanks,

Dan

Dan Jagoditsh | Shop Foreman
(307) 778-7458 | wrrc.us

s

o WASATCH

Railroad Contractors

On 10/10/2019 10:42 AM, Malarkey Wall wrote:
Dan: I'm assuming that the blowdown will be on the front end of the firebox? Is that where?

From: Dan Jagoditsh

Sent: Thursday, October 10, 2019 6:51 AM

To: Malarkey Wall

Subject: Re: Malarkey Wall Invoice WRRC331 from Wasatch Railroad Contractors
Mr. Wall,

Attached are the pictures of what your blow down will look like.

Thanks,

Dan

Dan Jagoditsh | Shop Foreman
{307) 778-7458 | wrrc.us

L

o WASATCH

Railroad Contractors

On 10/9/2019 4:03 PM, Malarkey Wall wrote:

Dan: P've never received anything other than the bill. All I need is the drawing of the blowdown. If you've sent it twice, it has

never come to my “junk” or my inbox. | don’t know what’s going on???? The invoice came just fine... Thanks, Malarkey {Please try

again..... It must come to this address, malarkeywall@outlook.com...

From: Dan Jagoditsh
Sent: Wednesday, October 9, 2019 12:05 PM

To: Malarkey Wall
Subject: Re: Malarkey Wall Invoice WRRC331 from Wasatch Railroad Contractors

I've sent you the pictures of it twice.

Dan Jagoditsh | Shop Foreman
(307) 778-7458 | wrrc.us

k4

o WASATCH

Railroad Contractors

On 10/9/2019 12:03 PM, Malarkey Wall wrote:

10/10/2019
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No problem on the invoice, but | need the drawing of the lowdown!when will you send it ?
Sent from my iPhone
On Oct 9, 2019, at 10:44 AM, Dan Jagoditsh <djagoditsh@wsrrc.us> wrote:

Mr. Wall,

Attached you will find the invoice for the parts ordered for the locomotive blow down valve. This invoice
will be acceptable for the down payment for your project.

Thanks,

Dan

Wasatch Railroad Contractors

e amountove $1,571.63

Dear Malarkey Wall:

Your invoice-WRRC331 for $1,571.63 is attached. Please note that all invoices
are Net 10 terms.

Please make your payment payable to Wasatch Railroad Contractors. If paying
by ACH, please e-mail a payment remittance to ar@wrrc.us in order for your
payment to post correctly.

If you have any questions about your invoice, please reach out to our Director of
Finance at the phone number listed below.

Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,
Wasatch Railroad Contractors

3077787458

Virus-free. www.avast.com

<Inv_WRRC331_from_Wasatch_Railroad_Contractors_70044.pdf>

10/10/2019




